
From: 	 Simon Zweighaft 
To: 	 Belizaire, Justine [USA] 
CC: 	 baig@pbworld.com; Kurio, Phyllis; Hamayasu, Toru 
Sent: 	 7/8/2009 5:06:22 PM 
Subject: 	 RE: Please Confirm 
Attachments: 	 CPP Cost Summary Airport Modifications 021109 v2r.xls 

Hi Justine: 

I hope to get the answer on cost effectiveness in a few minutes. Otherwise it will be 
tomorrow. 

The most recent breakdown of project costs by contract package that I have is attached. Please 
note the cost is in Q42007$ and reflects 67 vehicles. This information is only for the 
construction/procurement contracts and does not include soft costs, right-of-way or project 
reserve. Does this help or do you want me to have it conformed to year of expenditure $ and 
correct the fleet size? Please consider this information highly confidential. 

Simon 

	Original Message 	 
From: Belizaire, Justine [USA] [mailto:Belizaire Justine@bah.com ] 
Sent: Wednesday, July 08, 2009 6:10 AM 
To: Simon Zweighaft 
Subject: Please Confirm 

Good Morning Simon, 

Please confirm the project cost effectiveness is still $17.78. 

Also, FTA is asking for the estimated cost of the first segment and whether the City has a 
break down of the Project Cost by contract package. 

Please call me at 704-543-0975 or 786-586-0026 if you have any questions. 

Justine A. Belizaire-Gouveia 
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