
From: 	 Garrido, Lorenzo 
To: 	 'Mantych, Timothy' 
CC: 	 'Tsiforas, William'; 'Berliner©infraconsultlIc.conl 
Sent: 	 9/10/2010 8:42:29 AM 
Subject: 	 RE: WOFH Precast Yard 

Hi Tim, 

I've noted my responses in [brackets] below. 

Regards, 
Lorenzo Garrido, PE 
Assistant Project Officer 
Facilities and Design-Build Contracts 
DTS Rapid Transit Division 
City and County of Honolulu 
1099 Alakea Street, Suite 1700 
Honolulu, HI 96813 
808-768-6191 (office) 
808-295-2810 (mobile) 
tgarrido@honolulu.gov  

From: Ma ntych, Timothy [ma i Ito:Timothy. Ma ntych@jacobs.corn] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 07, 2010 10:03 AM 
To: Garrido, Lorenzo 
Cc: Tsiforas, William; Berliner@infraconsultlIc.com  
Subject: WOFH Precast Yard 

Lorenzo — I am trying to respond to an inquiry from Region 9 regarding Kiewit's precast yard. I have two questions: 

Did PB develop a separate engineers estimate for development of a precast yard? My assumption is they did not 
since they would not have known whether the selected contractor would be using an existing facility or developing a new 
facility. In my experience, we always incorporated those costs into the unit price estimates. Can you confirm this is the 
case here? [Yes, the GEC incorporated the casting activity costs, which included all costs for setting up the yard as well 
as casting all of the segments, into the unit price estimates.] 

It looks like costs for the precast yard may be spread out over a few line items (P106B Site Preparation and A1020 
Mobilization). Can you confirm? [Yes, the costs are spread out over several items, including the activities for erecting 
the segments.] 

Thanks 
Tim 

NOTICE - This communication may contain confidential and privileged 
information that is for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any viewing, 
copying or distribution of, or reliance on this message by unintended 
recipients is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in 
error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting 
it from your computer. 
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