
From: 	 Day, Elizabeth (FTA) 
To: 	 Nelson, Ketrina (FTA) 
CC: 	 Eckmann, Alex (FTA); Holland, Tonya (FTA); Ryan, James (FTA); Borinsky, Susan (FTA) 
Sent: 	 3/25/2010 9:23:28 AM 
Subject: 	 RE: Honolulu Questions 

Hi Ketrina 
One more Honolulu contact us that can use the same canned response. You probably want to notify Dave (if you have 
not already) that there is another slew of Honolulu contact us submissions coming in. 
Thanks, 
Beth 

From: Holland, Tonya (FTA) 
Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2010 1:51 PM 
To: Day, Elizabeth (FTA) 
Cc: Eckmann, Alex (FTA) 
Subject: Honolulu Questions 

3rd Honolulu Contact Tool question. This one is really a comment. 

Special Note: There is a total of 5 questions/comments. 

Requestor:  gmgsurfqins.com 	 Date Submitted: 03/25/2010 03:47 AM 

Status: New 	 Category: Planning & Environment 

Question: "Honolulu rail financing will get extra scrutiny by governor" 

"Do it quickly, and make sure you explain to the legislators 
and the public how much it's going to cost and where that money 
is going to come from" Mayor Muffy Said. 

Yes, just like how Muffy did the EIS Quickly and we saw 
"No Showstoppers" and it broke ground for Rail in December 2009! 

Or like how the EIS has been "99.5% ready" for MONTHS yet 
somehow Muffy can't get the other .5% DONE and over to the 
FTA- who then gives Gov. Lingle the OFFICAL copy to review. 

Muffy said "Explain to the legislators and the public how much 
it's going to cost"- like how Muffy explained that Rail was 
going to cost $3 Billion- then $3.5, $4, $4.5, $5. $5.5 Billion. 

Muffy is SO HONEST with the "facts" -as he see them. 

How about how Muffy said any rail DELAY would cost $200 Million 
a year- or BLEEDS $16.5 MILLION a MONTH - all because of Muffy's 
EIS BUNGLES. So far Muffy has BLOWN $66.4 MILLION of Oahu Tax-Payer 
Money on HIS BUNGLED RAIL DELAY! 

Tonya P. Holland 
Community Planner/ Special Asst. 
FTA Office of Planning and Environment 
1200 New Jersey Avenue SE  -  New Address 
Washington, DC 20590 
202-493-0283  -  direct 
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