
From: 	 Simon Zweighaft 
To: 	 'Belizaire, Justine [USA]' 
Sent: 	 3/25/2009 2:15:25 PM 
Subject: 	 RE: HHCTCP Project Status Report 

Hi Justine: 

The cost estimate should be posted on the file sharing site by Friday. The group is meeting on the financial plan later 
this month. I'm pretty sure that we will be able to come out with it by the end of April. My understanding is that the risk 
assessment of the pre-PE planning can be done without the financial plan and that one does not necessarily need to 
have a "balanced" financial plan to obtain permission to enter PE. 

Simon 

From: Belizaire, Justine [USA] [mailto:Belizaire Justine@bah.com ] 
Sent: Monday, March 23, 2009 3:46 PM 
To: Simon Zweighaft 
Subject: HHCTCP Project Status Report 

Simon, 

Thanks for the updates. One last item, when do you anticipate submitting a revised project cost estimate 
and financial plan based on the airport alignment? 

ju/stitie a. [Bdi/z.cd,te-cautteitz 
Associate 

Booz I Allen I Hamilton  

10138 Paxton Run Road 
Charlotte, NC 28277 
Office (704) 543-0975 
Cell (786) 586-0026 
belizaire justineAbah.com  

(Note new contact information) 
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